
  

 

3789 62nd Avenue North 
Pinellas Park, FL 33781 

Quote 
Quote # 

Date 

Expires 

Sales Rep 

Shipping Method 

Customer 

Customer # 

QT1666927 

02/09/2023 

03/31/2023 

Bessler, Alexander G 

FedEx Ground 

PINELLAS PARK FIRE DEPT (FL) 

C47457 

Bill To 
Pinellas Park Fire Department 
11350 43rd Street 
Clearwater FL 33762 
United States 

Ship To 
Pinellas Park Fire Department 
11350 43rd Street 
Clearwater FL 33762 
United States 

Item 
X8914021305A04 

Alt. Item # Units Description 
Air-Pak X3 Pro SCBA (2018 Edition) with Snap-
Change, Parachute Buckles, 4.5, Standard, No 
Accessory Pouch, E-Z Flo+ Regulator with Continuous 
Hose, Universal EBSS, None, No, SEMS II Pro, No 
Case, 2 SCBA Per Box 
List price: $10,024.33 
Lake County price: LIST 
Discount provided 

QTY 
5 

Unit Price 
$8,019.47 

Amount 
$40,097.35 

Subtotal $40,097.35 

Shipping Cost $0.00 

Tax Total $0.00 

Total $40,097.35 

This Quotation is subject to any applicable sales tax and shipping & handling charges that may apply.  Tax and shipping charges are 
considered estimated and will be recalculated at the time of shipment to ensure they take into account the most current information. 

All returns must be processed within 30 days of receipt and require a return authorization number and are subject to a restocking fee. 

Custom orders are not returnable. Effective tax rate will be applicable at the time of invoice. 

PRICING PER LAKE COUNTY CONTRACT 22-730G 

SHIPPING INCLUDED 

QT1666927
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3/3/23, 5:03 PM Pinellas-park.com Mail - Re: Purchasing Review Requested- SCBA Airpacks Lake County Contract 

Debra Rose <drose@pinellas-park.com> 

Re: Purchasing Review Requested- SCBA Airpacks Lake County Contract 
1 message 

Gary Moskaluk <GMoskaluk@pinellas-park.com> Fri, Mar 3, 2023 at 2:00 PM 
To: Debra Rose <DRose@pinellas-park.com> 

I approved the piggyback of the Lake County contract. 

Gary Moskaluk 
Purchasing Director 
City of Pinellas Park 
(727)369-5711 

On Fri, Mar 3, 2023 at 10:08 AM Debra Rose <DRose@pinellas-park.com> wrote: 
Good morning Gary, 
PPFD requests Purchasing review and approval to place the attached contract purchase on the Council agenda. 
Thank you, 
Debra 

Debra A. Rose 
Administrative Services Director 
Pinellas Park Fire Department 
11350 43rd Street North 
Clearwater, FL 33762 
Tel. 727-369-5801 
Fax 727-369-5785 

PLEASE NOTE: All electronic mail sent to and from the City of Pinellas Park is subject to the Public Records provision 
of the Florida Statutes, and may be released as part of a public records request. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Alex Bowlby <ABowlby@pinellas-park.com> 
Date: Fri, Feb 17, 2023 at 9:47 AM 
Subject: SCBA Airpacks Quote and contract 
To: Debra Rose <DRose@pinellas-park.com> 

Debra, 

Here is the updated quote and contract. 

Chief Alex Bowlby/PP400 
Deputy Chief of Life Safety 
Pinellas Park Fire Department 
11350 43rd St. N. 
Pinellas Park, Florida 33762 
Office:  727-369-5802 
Fax: 727-369-5785 
Cell: 727-214-7852 
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