227 HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
\ SHERIFF’S OFFICE

»

CHAD CHRONISTER, SHERIFF
January 9, 2025

Aaron Watkins
awatkins@enforcementone.com
Enforcement One Inc.

381 Roberts Road

Oldsmar, Florida 34677

RE: Invitation to Bid 2024-025 Emergency Lights and Accessories
Dear Aaron Watkins:

Thank you for responding to the above-referenced solicitation. The bids have been
evaluated and an award has been made to your company effective January 13, 2025. The

published solicitation tabulation sheet is available at TeamHCSO.com, and enclosed for your
convenience.

There is a 72-hour dispute period as described in Section 3, Paragraph 12 of the
solicitation.

If you have any questions, please direct them to Marianne Theen at
MTheen@TeamHCSO.com, or Purchasing@HCSO.Tampa.FL.US.

Sincerely,

Vol

William W Spinelli, CPA
Chief Financial Officer

WVS/mt

Enclosure

P.0.BOX 3371 « TAMPA, FLORIDA 33601 » PHONE 813-247-8000 « TEAMHCSO.COM



HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE
2008 EAST EIGHTH AVENUE
TAMPA, FL 33605

FrANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
PURCHASING SECTION

(§15) g47- 5055

MTHFFN@TEAMHCSO.coM

BID 2024-025

Emergency Lights and Accessories

BID NUMBER: 2024-025

Emergency Lights and Accessories
Opened: December 19, 2024 15:00 EST

Change Order #: N/A

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Optional: Three (3) Bi-Annual (2 YR) Renewals

911 Circuits

HCSO Supplier SI-301295

CMJ Enterprises LLC
175 S. 11th St.
Lindenhurst, NY 11757

Chris Mollish
(516) 234-3588

cmollish@cmijemergencylighting.com

Brooking Industries

Federal Signal™

Gamber Johnson"

Go Rhino"

Havis”

Lund” Industries

OPS Public Safety”

Panorama" Antennas

Pro-Gard™

SETINA"

SoundOff Signal®

Streamlight”

Tuffy Security Products”

Whelen®

CMJ Custom Cabinets
Jotto

HCSO Supplier SI-233855

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
3810 W. Osborne Ave.
Tampa, FL 33614

Mark Sevigny
(813) 348-4866
bids@danasafetysupply.com

HCSO Supplier SI-260941

Enforcement One Inc.
381 Roberts Rd.
Oldsmar, FL 34677

James Warrell
(727) 816-9833
sales@enforcementone.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301296

ProLogic ITS. LLC
106 Northpoint Parkway
Building 2, Suite 350
Acworth, GA 30102
Cheryl Cox
(866) 923-0513
inside.sales@prologicits.com

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM LIST

Innovative

Relevant accessory brands not specifically
mentioned in Bid

LABOR RATE FOR INSTALLATION:
Not to Exceed

WARRANTY:

NOTES:

Federal Grant Compliance - Signed
EXCEPTIONS:

» 5 YR on All Labor

» 10 YR Whelen Products

»2-5 YR All Other Manufacturers
» Lifetime on CMJ Custom Cabinets

» Will honor and support all
supplied products for the warranty
period specified by each
manufacturer.

» Warranty period may vary by
Manufacturer and product line.

» Addition information provided by
Supplier at request.

HCSO Supplier SI-301221

Tier 3 Electronics, LLC
2611 Sammonds Rd.
Plant City, FL 33563

Bryan J. Perez
(813) 585-9421
tier3electronics@gmail.com

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

» Warranty as per product

Manufacturer. » Warranty as per product manuacturer.
» Labor warranty is for the life time of ~ »Labor warranty is 1 year.

the vehicle for fault and/or failure.

» Lifetime warranty on all installations.

* Relevant Brands quoted cost plus in
lieu of discount from list

* Relevant Brands quoted cost plus in
lieu of discount from list

Initial Term EXP 1-12-28
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ESTIMATE

Enforcement One Inc. sales@enforcementone.com
381 Roberts Rd +1(727) 816-9833
Oldsmar, FL 34677 www.enforcementone.com
Bill to

Tin Pham

Pinellas Park, City of

City of Pinellas Park

attn: Accounts Payable

PO Box 1100

Pinellas Park, FL 33780-1100

Estimate details Sales Rep: Nathan Spece
Estimate no.: 4802
Estimate date: 07/16/2025

Product/service Discount Description
Hillsborough Contract # 16-20
Tahoe Patrol

EB2**** FL FSA 0124
LEGACY WCX 54"
C399
CCTL7
C399SP
cvav
SA315P
SAK70

CEXAMP WeCanX EXTERNAL AMPLIFIER

CEM16 WeCanX 16 OUTPUT EXPANSION
MOD

SA315P SA315P SPEAKER, BLACK PLASTIC

Sak70 SA-315 MT KIT 2021 CHEVY TAHOE

Chowler WCX LOW FREQUENCY SIREN
SYSTEM

HWLRB32 New! Howler Mounting Bracket for
2021 Chevy Tahoe

Ship to
Tin Pham

Pinellas Park, City of

Pinellas Park Fire Rescue
attn: DC Jeremie Larson
11350 43rd St. North
Pinellas Park, FL 33781

Quantity

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

Rate

$2,850.00

$202.80

$144.00

$172.80

$0.00

$382.80

$0.00

Amount

$51,300.00

$3,650.40

$2,592.00

$3,110.40

$0.00

$6,890.40

$0.00



10.

11.

12.

13.

14,

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

TLI2J

TLI2J

TCRWX6

TLI2J

12D

12E

PSJ02FCR

PSBKT90

TLIR

TLIB

PEL2B

C-VSW-1012-TAH-1

C-EB40-CCS-1P

C-EB25-XTL-1P

C-EB**

C-LP3-USB-BL1

MMSU-1

CUP2-1004

C-ARM-1001

ION T-SERIES LINEAR DUO R/B
License Plate

ION T-SERIES LINEAR DUO R/B
Front Pit Bars

WeCanX TRACER 6-LAMP HOUSING

ION T-SERIES LINEAR DUO R/B
Sides of Push Bumper

DUO LINEAR ION RED/WHITE BLK

DUO LINEAR ION BLUE/WHITE BLK
Front of Push Bumper

STRIP-LITE+ DUO FLASHR RED/BLU
QTR Glass

STRIP-LITE+ 90 DEG MT KIT

ION T-SERIES LINEAR LT RED

ION T-SERIES LINEAR LT BLUE
Hatch Up

ASS'Y, PERIMETER LIGHT BLACK
Hatch Dome

Vehicle-Specific 22" Wide Angled
Console for 2025 Chevrolet Tahoe
Police Pursuit Vehicle

1-Piece Equipment Mounting Bracket,
4" Mounting Space, Fits Whelen
Cencom CCSRN, CCSRNTA, MPCO03

1-Piece Equipment Mounting Bracket,
2.5" Mounting Space, Fits Motorola
XTL2500, XTL5000-05, APX-7500,

Havis FP - Fill Console

Console Accessory Bracket Kit with 3
Lighter Plug Outlets W/ 1 USB-C & USB
Type A Dual Port Charger & 1 Blank for
Rectangular Accessories

Magnetic Mic Conversion Kit

Self-Adjusting Double Cup Holder
(Fixed Mount)

Internal Mount Armrest With Lockable
Accessory Pocket

36

36

36

36

18

18

36

36

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

$86.40

$86.40

$733.20

$86.40

$98.40

$98.40

$87.60

$14.40

$91.20

$91.20

$168.00

$645.84

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$138.24

$33.72

$48.24

$236.16

$3,110.40

$3,110.40

$26,395.20

$3,110.40

$1,771.20

$1,771.20

$3,153.60

$518.40

$1,641.60

$1,641.60

$3,024.00

$11,625.12

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$2,488.32

$606.96

$868.32

$4,250.88



20.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44.

45.

46.

47.

C-HDM-214

C-MD-119

C-APW-1258

C-ADP-101

7160-0250

USBC-4901

TP-E-SL6-FS-SS

PM-21TH

KP-21TH-SS

WG-21TH-SET

DP-21TH-SET

PS-21TH-O0S-RL-FX

AC-21TH-RGP2-2

CP-21TH-CARGO

CP-GB443212-TL

36-4045

36-4045PB

36-4045WC

8.5" Heavy-Duty Telescoping Pole,
Side Mount

Swing Arm With Motion Adapter

12" Accessory Pocket, 5.8" Deep For
3.3"W Section Of Wide Consoles

Universal Adapter Plate

Gamber NotePad V universal computer
cradle

The Lind USBC-4901 DC/DC Power
Adapter is designed to power your
mobile power devices that require a
USB-C input connector for power. This
USBC power adapter is capable of
providing a maximum of 60 Watts.

Full size Recessed Panel; Sliding
window; Square hole punched

2022-24 Chevy Silverado 1500 partition
mount. Extra seat-back recline. 100%
seat slide.

2021-24 Tahoe | 2021-24 Suburban 3-
Pc. kick panel with foot pockets

2021-24 Tahoe driver and passenger
side window guards, welded bars

2021-24 Chevy Tahoe driver and
passenger side door panel set

2021-24 Tahoe Plastic seat with OS
belts, rear partition polycarbonate
window, with fire ext. compartment

Tahoe rear cage airbag corridor gap
panels, set of driver and passenger
side.

2021-25 Tahoe redesigned tilt-up cargo
mount with electronics tray

44" W x 32" L x 12" H w/2 DL locking
handle Carpet top

Elite Push Bumper 2021 Tahoe

Elite Pit Bar 2021 Tahoe

Push Bumper Elite Wire Cover

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

$136.80

$272.88

$41.04

$51.12

$337.00

$156.00

$687.00

$0.00

$164.75

$271.00

$241.25

$1,596.75

$98.00

$712.80

$1,309.75

$488.89

$355.90

$34.74

$2,462.40

$4,911.84

$738.72

$920.16

$6,066.00

$2,808.00

$12,366.00

$0.00

$2,965.50

$4,878.00

$4,342.50

$28,741.50

$1,764.00

$12,830.40

$23,575.50

$8,800.02

$6,406.20

$625.32



48.

49.

50.

51.

52.

583.

54.

55.

56.

57.

36-6015W2

Install

Install

SKF5G2211DM

MB8U25

RFU-600-6

QWB760

Shipping

MIsSC

CH27.1.Clearwater.Core

Install

Note to customer

WESTIN WHELEN 2 ION LIGHT
CHANNEL

Installation of customer supplied Radio

Installation of customer supplied
camera system

Cradle Point Antenna - Black

3/4" Hole Mount - 25' - RG58U - No
Connector

Mini UHF Crimp Plug for RG58U /
LMR195

760-870 MHZ - Unity Gain - 1/4 Wave
Antenna

Shipping

Wires, Loom, Connectors, Ect

911 Circuits Custom Harness for
Pinellas Park PD

Installation

Total

This estimate is not guaranteed. The price named in the estimate is
an approximation of the project requirements as described by the
client. The actual cost may change after all of the project elements
have been negotiated and finalized. The client will be informed of any

changes in cost in advance.

This estimate is valid for 30 days.

Accepted date

Accepted by

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

18

810

$34.74 $625.32
$250.00 $4,500.00
$380.00 $6,840.00
$150.67 $2,712.06
$15.25 $274.50
$2.75 $49.50
$9.00 $162.00
$550.00 $9,900.00
$150.00 $2,700.00
$1,500.00 $27,000.00
$95.00 $76,950.00
$393,546.24
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