Bill Gavitt
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To: Ryan Mendrala
Cc: Ken Rowland; Kevin McLaughlin
Subject: Emailing: SKMBT_2&323030711330
Attachments: SKMBT_2832303077133C.pdf
Ryan:

Attached is our cost estimate for the 8" sewer repair on 70th. Ave. N., this estimate was based on our current Pinellas County Annual Sewer Contract.

Contract #21-0637-CP(PLU) FY2022-FY2024.

Our understanding is that the city would like Rowland Inc. excavate, well point and point repair existing 8" VC/CI Sewer Main so it can be Lined by others.

The City will maintain sewer bypass and all MOT (Road Closure) for duration of work. In addition, Rowland will leave shored up excavation until Linning
Contractor has completed their work, once lined, Rowland will proceed with backfill, road base and paving. All quantities will be field measure for payment. Any
additional work shall require revised work order and written consent from the city.

If the city would like to proceed, please respond as soon as possible so we can make arrangements to start as soon as tomorrow if needed.

If you have any questions or concerns, please call us.

Thank you

Bill Gavitt
General Superintendent

6855 102nd Ave. N.
Pinellas Park, FL 33782
Phone: (727) 545-3815
Fax: (727)546-8464

Your message is ready to be sent with the following fi'e or link attachments:



EMERGENCY WORK ORDER Description Bid 2023
s Emergency 8" Point Repair 70th. Ave. Pinellas Park (PO#xxxxxx ’ . March
Activity Do ouivundd Annual Sanitarygsewgr Gontracts PiD% 001272D, BID# 21-0637-((3P : Quantcy uie, | Malcost otmmer | valas
GROUP A - MOBILIZATION
2 101-0100-0002 Mobilization for Emergency Response 2000 EA 6,600.00 1 6,600.00
A 800-2111 Sheeting & Bacing, Pipe Trenches (Removed) 2,750.00 SF 30.00 160 4,800.00
11 S5S5-312333-309-1214 Well Point Dewatering Initial - 12'-14' Deep 20.00 EA 4,368.00 1 4,368.00
98  S§8-333301-301-90608 Remove Pipe 6" or 8" (Gravity Sewer) 400.00 LF 88.00 10 880.00
222 §8-312333-303-1214 Initial/Exploratory Excavation - 12'-14' Deep 20.00 EA 10,528.00 1 10,528.00
240  S$8-330134-307-B2-0810 WASTEWATER BY-PASS PUMPING SET UP AND OPERATIONS, 8"-10" DIAME1 50.00 EA/DAY 3,850.00 7 26,950.00
248  S$S5-333301-500-008P 8" Dia. Pipe Gravity Sewer Point Repair (PVC Replacement Pipe) 24.00 EA 2,600.00 1 2,6800.00
290 204-1000 ROADWAY BASE, Crushed Concrete/Graded Aggregate, Min. LBR 100, Variable Thi 200.00 CcY 154.00 10 1,540.00
292 334-3095-000 SUPERPAVE ASPHALT CONCRETE, Type SP 9.5, Fine, Traffic Level C, Variable Tt 150.00 TN 320.00 9.00 2,880.00
293 334-3125-000 SUPERPAVE ASPHALT CONCRETE, Type SP 12.5, Fine, Traffic Level C, Variable T 150.00 TN 320.00 6 1,920.00
299 380-1150 MILLING EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT, 1 1/2" Average Depth 600.00 SY 26.00 120.00 3,120.00
320 711-11-121 6" Solid line Yellow 2,000.00 LF 8.50 100 850.00
|GROUP UNSPECIFIED
325 9999-1000 UNSPECIFIED WORK 840,000.00 EA 1.00 - -
67,036.00

*City shall be responsible for All MOT*
*All quantities will be field measured for payment*
*Additional Fee for Density Testing if required*
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Bill Gavitt
= m

From: Sunshine 811 Exactix <no-reply@exactix.sunshine811.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 11:58 AM

To: Bill Gavitt

Subject: SSOCOF CONFRM 2023/03/07 #00000 066304324-000 EMER NEW

CONFRM 00000 CALL SUNSHINE 03/07/23 11:58:02ET 066304324-000 EMERGENCY STREET Ticket : 066304324 Rev:000 Taken: 03/07/23 11:56ET

State: FL Cnty: PINELLAS GeoPlace: PINELLAS PARK
CallerPlace: PINELLAS PARK
Subdivision:

Address :

Street : 70TH AVE N
Cross 1:37THST
Within 1/4 mile: Y

Locat: LOCATE INTER OF 70TH AVE N AND 37TH ST GOING 50FT IN ALL DIRECTION

Remarks : CREW IS ONSITE
EMERGENCY: BREAK IN AN UNDERGROUND FACILITY
*%* LOOKUP BY INTERSECTION ***

Grids :2750D8240A 2750D8241D

Work date: 03/07/23 Time: 11:54ET Hrs notc: 000 Category: 1 Duration: 02 WKS Due Date : 03/07/23 Time: 11:54ET Exp Date : 04/06/23 Time: 23:59ET Work
type: SEWER MAIN REPAIR Boring: N White-lined: N
Ug/Oh/Both: U Machinery: Y Depth: 12 FT Permits: N N/A Done for : CITY OF PINELLAS PARK

Company : ROWLAND INC Type: CONT

Co addr : 6855 102ND AVE N

City :PINELLAS PARK State: FL Zip: 33782

Caller : BILL GAVITT Phone: 727-545-3815 Contact : BILL GAVITT Phone: 727-423-6388
BestTime: 8-5

Mobile :727-423-6388

Fax :727-546-8464



Bill Gavitt

m e
From: irthnet@callsunshine.com

Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 1:37 PM

To: Bill Gavitt

Subject: Ticket 066304324 - Important Safety Message

To: ROWLAND INC Attn: BILL GAVITT

Voice: 7275453815 Fax: 7275468464

Re: Important Safety Message

We are responding to your request to locate our underground facilities in an area where you are planning excavation or demolition work. The following is the
current status of our facility marking in the area specified in your notification.

Ticket: 066304324
County: PINELLAS Place: PINELLAS PARK
Address: 70TH AVE N

PGSSTP (Gas):
Your dig site has been marked with yellow paint, flags, signs, or other similar
devices. If you need further information please contact Mason Spurgeon at
(813) 538-6761. .

Thank you for notifying Sunshine State One-call of Florida about your upcoming excavation. Please wait two full business days to allow us to mark our facilities.
On the job site, take precautions to protect all markings. If markings are no longer visible, or you have questions about them, stop excavating and call us at 877-
832-6747. To find the exact location of our pipelines, hand excavate the tolerance zone, which is 24 inches either side of the temporary markings.

This message was generated by an automated system. Please do not reply to this email.
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CITY HALL - P.0O.Box 1100 PINELLAS
PINELLAS PARK PARK, FL 33780-1100

* SIMPLY CENTERED * I

DATE: March 7, 2023

TO: Bart Diebold, City Manager

FROM: Gary Moskaluk, Purchasing Director

RE: Noncompetitive Item, Emergency Purchase

In compliance with Section 2-602, Section (A), City of Pinellas Park Code of Ordinances, it is requested that

at the City Council Agenda dated March g, 2023, an agenda item be certified by the Mayor as an emergency
purchase for the item listed below:

Emergency Sewer Repairs
(ITEM)

FOR Public Works/Utiliti
(DEPARTMENT/DIVISION)

Located at 20 Avenue N and 37* Street
To be purchased from Rowland, Inc.

o inell
(VENDOR ADDRESS & TELEPHONE NUMBER)

In the amount of $840,000.00

_@(‘7“?)\3?%;7

Department Adminictrator oF Division Director

—ZHY %
SFTv

Gary Moskaluk, Purchasing Director Sandra L. Bradbury, Mayor

5-3815

N
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