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Tom Appugliese <tappugliese@pinellas-park.com>

Re: Cisco Smartnet Maintenance renewal Contract quote
1 message

Gary Moskaluk <GMoskaluk@pinellas-park.com> Mon, Feb 27, 2023 at 9:47 AM
To: Tom Appugliese <tappugliese@pinellas-park.com>

Good morning Tom,

I approve the piggyback contract for the above items.

Gary Moskaluk
Purchasing Director
City of Pinellas Park
(727)369-5711

On Mon, Feb 27, 2023 at 8:56 AM Tom Appugliese <tappugliese@pinellas-park.com> wrote:
Gary, 

The attached quote from CDW has the #43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR  contract number for our CISCO Network
equipment Maintenance . 
I will be going to council for approval on March 9th .   Please verify that this contract is valid to use. 

Thank you 

Thomas Appugliese  
City of Pinellas Park, Chief Technology Officer / IT Administrator 
Office # 727-369-0650 | Fax # 727-369-7868 Tappugliese@pinellas-park.com  
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KELLEY MARTINEZ,

Thank you for considering CDW•G for your technology needs. The details of your quote are below. If 

you are an eProcurement or single sign on customer, please log into your system to access 

the CDW site. You can search for your quote to retrieve and transfer back into your system for 

processing.

For all other customers, click below to convert your quote to an order.

Convert Quote to Order 

QUOTE # QUOTE DATE QUOTE REFERENCE CUSTOMER # GRAND TOTAL

NGGT842 2/23/2023 SMARTNET COTERM 2023 7136088 $56,760.97

IMPORTANT - PLEASE READ

Special Instructions:   TAX:MULTIPLE TAX JURISDICTIONS APPLY

TAX: CONTACT CDW FOR TAX DETAILS

QUOTE DETAILS

ITEM QTY CDW# UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

Cisco SMARTnet Service Agreement 1 1504548 $15,933.56 $15,933.56

Mfg. Part#: CON-SNT-1-25K

UNSPSC: 81111812

Contract: Florida NVP Software

43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR

(ADSPO16-130652)

Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA

TAX: PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00 Contract:  
NASPO

Cisco SMARTnet extended service agreement 1 1504564 $16,966.69 $16,966.69

Mfg. Part#: CON-SNTP-1-25K

UNSPSC: 81111811

Contract: Florida NVP Software

43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR

(ADSPO16-130652)

Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA

TAX: PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00

Contract: NASPO

Cisco Solution Support - extended service agreement 1 5532343 $22,632.72 $22,632.72

1 3821408 $1,228.00 $1,228.00

Mfg. Part#: CON-SSSNP-1-100K

UNSPSC: 81111811

Contract: Florida NVP Software

43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR

(ADSPO16-130652)

Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA

TAX: PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00

Contract: NASPO 

Cisco SMARTnet Solution Support - extended service 

agreement

Mfg. Part#: CON-SSSNT-1-5K

Thank you for choosing CDW. We have received your quote.

Review and Complete Purchase

Thank you for considering CDWeG for your technology needs. The details of your quote are below. If you are an 
eProcurement or single sign on customer, please log into your system to access the CDW site. You can search 
for your quote to retrieve and transfer back into your system for processing.

For all other customers, click below to convert your quote to an order.
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KELLEY MARTINEZ,

Thank you for considering CDWeG for your technology needs. The details of your quote are below. If you are an 
eProcurement or single sign on customer, please log into your system to access the CDW site. You can search 
for your quote to retrieve and transfer back into your system for processing.

For all other customers, click below to convert your quote to an order.

" IMPORTANT - PLEASE READ

Special Instructions: TAX:MULTIPLE TAX JURISDICTIONS APPLY TAX: CONTACT CDW FOR TAX 
DETAILS

ITEM Qry cows# UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE
Cisco SMARTnet Service Agreement  Mfg. Part#: CON-SNT-1-25K 
 UNSPSC: 81111812  Contract: Florida NVP 
Software 43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR (ADSPO16-130652) 
 Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA  TAX: 
PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00 Contract: NASPO

 1504548 $15,933.56 $15,933.56

Cisco SMARTnet extended service agreement Mg, Parti#: CON-SNTP-1-25K 
 UNSPSC: 81111811  Contract: Florida NP 
Software 43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR (ADSPO16-130652) 
 Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA  TAX: 
PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00  Contract: NASPO

 1504564 $16,966.69 $16,966.69

Cisco Solution Support - extended service agreement Mfg. Part#: 
CON-SSSNP-1-100K  UNSPSC: 81111811  Contract: Florida 
NVP Software 43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR  (ADSPO16-130652) 
 Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA  TAX: 
PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00  Contract: NASPO

 5532343 $22,632.72 2,632.72

Cisco SMARTnet Solution Support - extended servi agreement 
 Mfg. Part#: CON-SSSNT-1-5K

 3821408 $1,228.00 $1,228.00



Page 2 of 2

QUOTE DETAILS (CONT.)

UNSPSC: 81111812

Contract: Florida NVP Software 
43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR

(ADSPO16-130652)

Electronic distribution - NO MEDIA 
TAX: PINELLAS PARK, FL .0000% $.00 
Contract: NASPO

SUBTOTAL

$56,760.97

SHIPPING

$0.00

SALES TAX

$0.00

GRAND TOTAL

$56,760.97

PURCHASER BILLING INFO

DELIVER TO

Billing Address:

CITY OF PINELLAS PARK

ACCTS PAYABLE

5141 78TH AVE N

PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781-2498

Phone: (727) 541-0741

Payment Terms: Net 30 Days-Govt State/Local

Shipping Address:

CITY OF PINELLAS PARK

INFORMATION TECH/PURCH DEPT

8000 60TH ST N

PINELLAS PARK, FL 33781-1335

Shipping Method: ELECTRONIC DISTRIBUTION

Please remit payments to:

CDW Government

75 Remittance Drive

Suite 1515

Chicago, IL 60675-1515

Sales Contact Info 

Bart Heckman   |  (877) 404-6297 | barthec@cdwg.com

Need Help?

My Account Support Call 800.800.4239

About Us | Privacy Policy | Terms and Conditions 

This order is subject to CDW's Terms and Conditions of Sales and Service Projects at

http://www.cdwg.com/content/terms-conditions/product-sales.aspx

For more information, contact a CDW account manager

© 2023 CDW•G LLC, 200 N. Milwaukee Avenue, Vernon Hills, IL 60061 | 800.808.4239

QUOTE DETAILS (CONT.) UNSPSC: 81111812 
 Contract: Florida NVP Software 
43230000-NASPO-16-ACS-SVAR 
(ADSPO16-130652) 
 Electronic distribution 
- NO MEDIA TAX: PINELLAS PARK, 
FL .0000% $.00 Contract: NASPO

Please remit payments to:

CDW Government  75 Remittance 
Drive Suite 1515  Chicago, 
IL 60675-1515

Sales Contact Info

Bart Heckman | (877) 404-6297 | barthec@cdwag.com

Call 800.800.4239

This order is subject to CDW's Terms and Conditions of Sales and Service Projects at

-conditions/product-sales.aspx
For more information, contact a CDW account manager

ﾩ 2023 CDWeG LLC, 200 N. Milwaukee Avenue, Vernon Hills, IL 60061 | 800.808.4239
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