
 

2/4/2020 Pinellas-park.com Mail - Fwd: G Business Suite/Daston 

Tom Appugliese <tappugliese@pinellas-park.com> 

Fwd: G Business Suite/Daston 
1 message 

Tom Fairbank <tfairbank@pinellas-park.com> Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 3:44 PM 
To: Tom Appugliese <tappugliese@pinellas-park.com> 

Thank you Tom. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Gary Moskaluk <GMoskaluk@pinellas-park.com>
	
Date: Mon, Feb 3, 2020, 3:42 PM
	
Subject: G Business Suite/Daston
	
To: Tom Fairbank <tfairbank@pinellas-park.com>
	

Good afternoon Tom, 

I have reviewed the contract for the Daston G Suite Business license renewals. I approve the use of this contract #GS-
35F0555K for $54,526.50.
	

Thank you. 

Gary Moskaluk
	
Purchasing Director
	
City of Pinellas Park
	
(727)369-5711
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Estimate
 

Date Estimate # 
1/30/2020 1688-ES 

Daston Corporation 
19 E Market St # LL01 
Leesburg VA 20176-3004 
United States 

Bill To Contact Information 
City of Pinellas Park, FL Adam Ulan 
6051 78th Avenue, North Certified Google Apps Sales Specialist 
Pinellas Park FL 33780-1100 Daston Corporation, a Google Premier Partner 
United States Cell: 703-963-5036 (Primary) 

Quote Expires 

2/29/2020 

Memo: 
G Suite Business Renewal for Pinellas Park 
3/8/2020-3/7/2021. GSA Contract # GS35F0555K 

Item Qty Description Rate Amount 
G Suite Business 577 G Suite Business: New/Renewal 

Google - GAPPS-UNLIM-1-USER-12MO 
Start Date: 03/07/2019 
End Date: 03/08/2020 
Type: Renewal 3+ 
Product: Business 
Customer Domain Name: pinellas-park.com 

94.50 54,526.50 

Total $54,526.50 

Approval__________________________  Date______________ 

Daston is a SBA approved small HUBZone and Woman Owned Business. 
For verification see SAM.GOV 

http://www.carahsoft.com/application/files/5014/4545/3072/GAFW_Passthrough_10_21_2015.pdf 

http://www.carahsoft.com/application/files/5014/4545/3072/GAFW_Passthrough_10_21_2015.pdf
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